" ADM- PUR-FOOG g
February15 2020 J

= ~ pocumentNo:

BAGUIO WATER DISTRIC iﬁgctuwty Date:

“Serving Mankind iy Serving 7 Revision No- R iees 52 REER
003 Purok BWD, Brgy., Marcoville, Baguio City
Tel. No. 442-4858 Fax No. 442-4858/444- -7245 “0 0 3 5 8 0 9

PURCHASE ORDER

Supplier . AVK PHILIPPINES, INC. PO. No. : 35809
Tel No./ Fax No. :_(02 376-6400 to 01 7 Date . February 27,
Address / TIN :MQ-C ' PR No./Abstract No. : 02-192P-B

Gentlemen/ Madam,

Please furnish this Office the following articles subject to the terms and conditions contained herein.
Blace of Delivery : [ Pickup 0. Valid Until :__ 20 X7
@ FOB BWD Warehouse arranty - [1Six monthsi One year[_—_] Others(Pls. Specify),
[ Deliver at site W tkin R B IR
Date of Delivery : [ZZJ] Working days - : /1% Retention Required

ey Calendar Days upon receipt of PO ___Performance Bond Required (5% if in check/50% if GSIS surety bond)

Delivery Term . [ full [ partial delivery allowed /Sublect to testing / inspection prior to payment
paymentTerm :[JCOD 130 Days [ Others(Pls. Specify) *

i —

Unit Cost Amount

Quantity Description/ Specifications

\ 8 pcs 2"@ Gate Valve, flanged type witH combination flanges and sealing . 11,246.08 P 89,968.64
. ring and bolts & nuts "AVK" ~

16 pcs A"@ Gate Valve, flanged type with combination flanges and sealing 16,187.90 259,006.40 *
) ring and bolts & nuts "AVK" "

10 pcs 4"@ Gate Valve, flanged type with companion steel flanges and . 14,437.43 144,374.30.
: *  BNG "AVK"
’ 6 pcs 6"0 Gate Valve, flanged type with combination flanges and sealing 27,269.97 163,619.82 .
: > ring and bolts & nuts’ "AVK" \
8 - pecs : 8"@ Gate Valve, flanged type with combination flanges and sealing 42,383.30 339,066.40 .
ring and bolts & nuts 'AVK" o P 996,035.56

X-X-X-X—X-X-)(-)(-X

\ (Please refer to the attached sheet for complete detailed sgecifications)_

‘Usage / Requisitioner  4th Quarter Consolodated Supplies and Materials .

Checked by: Audited by:
3}
ATTY.C NELL OLOR D. DE GUZMAN LUZVIMIN G/RA : d
Admin Division Manager !nternal Auduor AGM -Adm. /Com /Fan
Signature over Printed Name of Supplier Date
Funds Available: Acct. :

Operating / Maintenance Expense

 JELYND.PENALES ——— CAPEX

Finance Manager Other Payables A




BAGUIO WATER DISTRICT
BWD Compound, Utility Road, Baguio City 2600

ADM-PUR-F006

Document No.

Revision Date | February 15, 2020

e

Supplier/Contractor - ~ AVK PHILIPPINES, INC. e | Purchase Order No. 35809 o
Contact Number _02-376-6400 to 01 Date February 27, 2024 °

. 70 West Ave. Brgy. West Triangle, Q.C '| PR No./Abstract No.

3 7o WestAve, Begy. e e

Address / TIN

Description D
2 6 Gate Valve, flanged type with combination flanges and sealing ring and
bolts and nuts “AVK” -

.

Unit Cost
11,246.08.

 89,968.64,

16,187.90 |

'259,006.40.

g ring and

4” @ Gate Valve, flanged type with combination flanges and sealin
bolts and nuts “AVK” ° e T TR Foane
" 4” @ Gate Valve, flanged type with companjgnjgguh_n&i@ﬂ\iw’
6” @ Gate Valve, flanged type with combination flanges and sealing ring and
bolts and nuts, “AVK” .
8” @ Gate Valve, flanged type with combination flanges and sealing ring and
bolts and nuts “AVK” S
GATE VALVE FLANGED TYPE SPECIFICATIONS:
Design Code: Hydraulic test to BS 5163 (DIN3230/ DIN3352) or JIS B2043, DIN *
3352, AWWA C5089, BS5163 ; Maximum Pressure: PN16 or 16 bar; -
Temperature Range: -20 to 160 degrees centigrade ; Face to Face: BS 5163 or »
JIS B2002, DIN 3202-F5, DIN 3202-F4, ANSI B16.10, BS 5163 ; End Flange:
EN1092-2 (1SO 7005-2) or JIS B2212 10K, DIN 2533 PN 10/16, ANSI 150#, -
BS4504 PN 10/16 ; Tightness Test: Operating Torque Test or JIS B2003, DIN
3230, AWWA C509, BS 6755 ; Materials: Body: Ductile Iron, GGG-50to DIN
1693 (BS 2789 grade 500-7) or Ductile Iron ; Wedge: Ductile Iron (DI) + NBR or -
Ductile Iron, GGG-50, core fully encapsulated with EPDM rubber with integral -
wedge nut of dezincification resistant brass, CZ 132 to BS 2874 ; Wedge Nut:
Brass or Dezincification Resistant Brass ; Stem: Stainless Steel, DINX 20 Cr13 °
or Stainless Steel / Brass ; Bonnet Gasket: EPDM Rubber or EPDM / NBR *
Bonnet: Ductile Iron (DI) or Stainless Steel A2, sealed with hot melt
O-Ring: NBR or EPDM / NBR ; Stem Collar: Brass ; Gland Flange: Ductile Iron o
Ductile Iron GJS-500-7 (GGG-50) ; Dustproof Ring: NBR or EPDM /NBR 4%
Hex Nut: Cast Iron

144,374.30.

163,619.82

42,383.30.

Overall Dimensions:

Size / DN Length (L) Height (H) Width (D) Weight
mm mm mm (kgs.)
2”/DN50 178 300 - 241 160« 165 13 -iy
4” /DN100 229 334 « 430 | 200-220 26 -2€
6”/DN150 267 448 - 505|260-285 5167
8”/DN200 292 62-680 320-340 77-83 .
Total: #996,035.56 .
Usage: 4" Quarter Consolidated Supplies and Materials
Prepared by:  Checked by: Audited by: Recommending Approved by:
Approval:
. l 9’/21 @r D& %/\ =
\G. Lamangan Atty. C.D:De Guzman L. G. Ramo .Tenedero

r. Salvador M. Royeca ~

SMPO Administrative Div. Internal Auditor 4 General Manager
Manager

AGM
Adm./Com./Fin./ICT
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< | _BAGUIO WATER DISTRICT T Document Code: BAC_IH
\ 7,4‘23: .ds and Awards Committee | Document No. BAC_IH_F002
S (In-house) Effective Date: 16 March 2020
RESOLUTION Revision No. 00
BIDS AND AWARDS COMMITTEE
RESOLUTION NO. 034-2024

Request for Quotation (RQ) No. 10-192P-B:
Ball Valves, Check Valves, Gate Valves, HDPE Coupling, et al.

° CERTIFICATION
INTERNATIONAL
150 9001:2015

WHEREAS, the Baguio Water District-Bids and Awards Committee (BWD-BAC), in accordance with
the provisions of Republic Act (RA) No. 9184, conducted the bidding for the procurement of the
following, all with required specifications under RQ No. 10-192P-B, dated 31 October 2023, under
a two-envelope system of bidding but not to be awarded on a one lot basis and with approved

budget unit costs of:

l;f:‘ Quantity Description (pe?ﬁ?ece )
1 500 pieces % Ball Valve/ Stop Cock Ball Type-Lock Wing Php580.00
2 10 pieces 1” Ball Valve/ Stop Cock Ball Type-Lock Wing Php1,138.00
3 15 pieces 1” Check Valve, Class 125 Php720.00
4 18 pieces 13" Check Valve, Class 125 Php2,225.00
5 345 pieces 17 @ Gate Valve, Threaded Type Class 125 Php846.00
6 10 pieces li" @ Gate Valve, Threaded Type Class 125 Php1,714.00
7 5 pieces 2” @ Gate Valve, Threaded Type Class 125 Php2,642.00
8 8 pieces 2” @ Gate Valve, flanged type with combination Php11,600.00

flanges and sealing ring and bolts & nuts
9 16 pieces 4” @ Gate Valve, flanged type with combination

flanges and sealing ring and bolts & nuts Php22,075.00
10 10 pieces 4" @ Gate Valve, flanged type with companion

steel flanges and BNG Php30,665.00

11 6 pieces 6” @ Gate Valve, flanged type with combination

flanges and sealing ring and bolts & nuts Php38,945.00
12 8 pieces 8” @ Gate Valve, flanged type with combination

flanges and sealing ring and bolts & nuts Php54,570.00
13 140 pieces " @ HDPE Coupling Php246.00
14 13 pieces " @ HDPE Coupling Php207.50
15 100 pieces 1" @ HDPE Coupling Php372.00
16 500 pieces §" @ HDPE Male Coupling Adapter Php186.00
17 170 pieces 2" @ HDPE Male Coupling Adapter Php132.00
18 240 pieces - 1" @ HDPE Male Coupling Adapter Php148.00
19 250 pieces 1" @ Poly BST Elbow “Plasson” Php291.80
20 210 pieces 2" x 1” Tapping Saddle Php4,196.00
21 65 pieces 3” x 1” Tapping Saddle Php4,496.00

5 22 143 pieces 4" x 1” Tapping Saddle Php4,564.00

23 33 pieces 6” x 1” Tapping Saddle Php5,844.00
24 8 pieces Universal Tapper 8” x 1” (for PVC) Php14,762.00
25 10 pieces Universal Tapper 10” x 1” (for PVC) Php15,380.00
26 5 pieces Universal Tapper 12” x 1” (for PVC) Php15,708.00

WHEREAS, AVK PHILIPPINES, INC. and FANM ENTERPRISES, INC. submitted their bids and
during the opening of the technical bids on 06 December 2023, it was determined that both
bidders submitted complete documentary requirements thus, their bids were rated “passed”;

WHEREAS, the bidders’ technical proposals were endorsed to the Technical Working Group
(TWG) for evaluation, and on 12 January 2024 the TWG rated the offers of AVK PHILIPPINES,
INC. for items 8-12 as “complying” and items 24 - 26 as “non-complying” for its failure to meet
the required specifications indicated in the bidding documents, while the bids of FANM
ENTERPRISES, INC. were all rated as “complying”;

WHEREAS, AVK PHILIPPINES, INC. did not submit any offer for items 1-7 and 13-23; while FANM
ENTERPRISES did not submit any offer for items 24-26;

WHEREAS, AVK PHILIPPINES, INC. was informed through a letter on 27 January 2024 of its non-
complying bids and was given a period of three (3) calendar days upon receipt of the said letter
to file its request for reconsideration however, the period granted has already lapsed and no
request for reconsideration was received by the BWD-BAC. Thus, its “failed ”rating became final
on 30 January 2024; (A copy of the letter is hereto attached as Annex A)

WHEREAS, on 06 February 2024, the financial bids of AVK PHILIPPINES, INC. and FANM
ENTERPRISES, INC. were opened and the bids as read and calculated are as follows:

D%WW’ ‘ @Aq@ﬂbw é@w



BAC Resolution 034-2024
Request for Quotation (RQ) No. * “92P-B

Ball Valves, Check Valves, Gate

es, HDPE Coupling, etc.

%
BID PRICE VARIANCE ABC
DESCRIPTION (per piece) FROM (per piece)
ABC
AVK PHILIPPINES, INC.
1n
] Ball Valve/ Stop Cock Ball Type-Lock No bid . Php580.00
W1ng
” ‘INH]?;H Valve/ Stop Cock Ball Type-Lock No bid " Php1,138.00
3 | 1" Check Valve, Class 125 No bid - Php720.00
4 | 13" Check Valve, Class 125 No bid - Php2,225.00
5 }2? Gate Valve, Threaded Type Class No bid ) Php846.00
1n
6 152 5@ Gate Valve, Threaded Type Class No bid ) Php1,714.00
- %2 S@ Gate Valve, Threaded Type Class No bid 3 Php2,642.00
2" @ Gate Valve, flanged type with
8 | combination flanges and sealing ring and | Phpl 1,246.08 3.05% Php11,600.00
bolts & nuts
4" @ Gate Valve, flanged type with
9 | combination flanges and sealing ring and | Php16,187.90 26.66% Php22,075.00
bolts & nuts
4" @ Gate Valve, flanged type with
10 companion steel flanges and BNG Php14,437.43 52.91% Php30,665.00
6" @ Gate Valve, flanged type with
11 | combination flanges and sealing ring and | Php27,269.97 29.97% Php38,945.00
bolts & nuts
8" @ Gate Valve, flanged type with
12 | combination flanges and sealing ring and | Php42,383.30 22.33% Php54,570.00
bolts & nuts
13 | " @ HDPE Coupling No bid - Php246.00
14 | 2’ @ HDPE Coupling No bid - Php207.50
15 | 17 @ HDPE Coupling No bid - Php372.00
16 | 2" @ HDPE Male Coupling Adapter No bid - Php186.00
17 | 2’ © HDPE Male Coupling Adapter No bid - Php132.00
18 | 1” @ HDPE Male Coupling Adapter No bid - Php148.00
19 | 1” @ Poly BST Elbow “Plasson” No bid - Php291.80
20 | 2” x 1” Tapping Saddle No bid - Php4,196.00
21 | 3” x 1” Tapping Saddle No bid - Php4,496.00
22 | 4” x 1” Tapping Saddle No bid - Php4,564.00
23 | 6” x 1” Tapping Saddle No bid - Php5,844.00
24 | Universal Tapper 8" x 1” (for PVC) Non-complying - Php14,762.00
25 | Universal Tapper 10" x 1” (for PVC) Non-complying - Php15,380.00
26 | Universal Tapper 12" x 1” (for PVC) Non-complying - Php15,708.00
FANM ENTERPRISES, INC.
1
=" Ball Vval -
1 %Ninga 1 Valve/ Stop Cock Ball Type-Lock Php580.00 -0- Php580.00
> \l«lir?;ll Valve/ Stop Cock Ball Type-Lock Php1,138.00 -0- Php1,138.00
3 | 1” Check Valve, Class 125 Php720.00 -0- Php720.00
4 1—12-" Check Valve, Class 125 Php2,225.00 -0- Php2,225.00
1
5 125@ Gate Valve, Threaded Type Class Php846.00 -0- Php846.00
1"
6 1225(3 Gate Valve, Threaded Type Class Php1,714.00 -0- Php1,714.00
7 %ZSQ Gate Valve, Threaded Type Class Php2,642.00 -0- Php2,642.00
2” @ Gate Valve, flanged type with
8 | combination flanges and sealing ring and | Php11,844.00 -2.10% Php11,600.00
bolts & nuts
4” @ Gate Valve, flanged type with
combination flanges and sealing ring and Php23,001.00 -4.19% Php22,075.00
bolts & nutg,

il ﬁ’ﬂx@é e M St




BAC Resolution 034-2024
Request for Quotation (RQ) No. ~192P-B

Ball Valves, Check Valves, Gate

ses, HDPE Coupling, etc.

%
BID PRICE VARIANCE ABC
DESCRIPTION (per piece) FROM (per piece)
ABC

4" @ Gate Valve, flanged type with Php30.665.00
- companion steel flanges and BNG Php28,130.00 s i 1

6" @ Gate Valve, flanged type with
11 | combination flanges and sealing ring and Php39,310.00 -0.93% Php38,945.00

bolts & nuts

8" @ Gate Valve, flanged type with
12 | combination flanges and sealing ring and Php55,803.00 -2.25% Php54,570.00

bolts & nuts
13 | 2" @ HDPE Coupling Php246.00 -0- Php246.00
14 | @ HDPE Coupling Php207.50 -0- Php207.50
15 | 17 @ HDPE Coupling Php372.00 -0- Php372.00
16 | >" @ HDPE Male Coupling Adapter Php186.00 -0- Php186.00
17 | 2’ @ HDPE Male Coupling Adapter Php132.00 -0- Php132.00
18 | 1” @ HDPE Male Coupling Adapter Php148.00 -0- Php148.00
19 | 1” @ Poly BST Elbow “Plasson” Php291.80 -0- Php291.80
20 | 2" x 1" Tapping Saddle Php4,196.00 -0- Php4,196.00
21 | 3” x 1” Tapping Saddle Php4,496.00 -0- Php4,496.00
22 | 4” x 1” Tapping Saddle Php4,564.00 -0- Php4,564.00
23 | 6” x 1” Tapping Saddle Php5,844.00 -0- Php5,844.00
24 | Universal Tapper 8” x 1" (for PVC) No bid - Php14,762.00
25 | Universal Tapper 10" x 17 (for PVC) No bid - Php15,380.00
26 | Universal Tapper 12" x 1" (for PVC) No bid - Php15,708.00

WHEREAS, for item no. 19 the handwritten bid of FANM ENTERPRISES, INC. of Php291.80
prevails over the type-written bid of Php291.00;

WHEREAS, upon post-qualification,
documents submitted by and of the
the financial bids of AVK PHILIPPINES, INC. for items 8-12 are th

careful examination, validation, and verification of all the
financial bids of the bidders, it has been determined that
e lowest calculated responsive

bids; while the financial bids of FANM ENTERPRISES, INC. for items 1-7 and 13-23 are
determined to be the lone calculated responsive bids;

NOW THEREFORE, on motion duly seconded, be it

RESOLVED, as it is hereby resolved,
awarding the procurement of items
lone calculated responsive bidder an

calculated bidder with their offered brands, specifications, and bid prices;

to recommend to the Head of the Procuring Entity (HOPE)
1-7 and 13-23 to FANM ENTERPRISES, INC. for being the
d items 8-12 to AVK PHILIPPINES, INC. for being the lowest

RESOLVED further, to declare a failure of bidding for the procurement of items 24-26 as the
received bids are determined non-complying with the BWD specifications.

UNANIMOUSLY APPROVED (08 February 2024)

/
r

il
%’%ﬂejt alpito Rodrigg
ice-Chairpersg
1ano

lyéfneo éa.(ﬁé Engr. Do

Member
Atty. Ma
Chairperson
Attested by:
Appléja . Aviles
Secretariat

Approved by:

3|Pai>':"'

o

(*MNQN\I-&/
Shasfene M. Durante
Secretariat
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