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 BAGUIO WATER DISTRICT 

Bids and Awards Committee 

(In-house) 

Document Code: BAC_IH 

Document No. BAC_IH_F002 

Effective Date: 16 March 2020 

RESOLUTION Revision No. 00 
 

 

 
 
 
 

 

WHEREAS, the Baguio Water District-Bids and Awards Committee (BWD-BAC), in accordance with 

the provisions of Republic Act (RA) No. 9184, conducted the bidding for the procurement of the 

following, all with required specifications under RQ No. 03-038P-C, dated 11 March 2024, under 

a two-envelope system of bidding but not to be awarded on a one lot basis and with approved 

budget unit costs of: 

 

Item 

No.  
Quantity Description 

ABC  

(per piece) 

1 5 pieces 1” Air release valve  Php15,400.00 

2 2 pieces 2” Air release valve Php27,527.00 

3 1,360 pieces 
1

2
” Ball valve/ stop cock ball type-lock wing 

(Threaded) 

Php638.00 

4 22 pieces 
3

4
” Ball valve/ stop cock ball type-lock wing 

(Threaded) 

Php915.00 

5 5 pieces 1” Ball valve/ stop cock ball type-lock wing 

(Threaded) 
Php1,252.00 

6 1,500 pieces 
1

2
” Check valve, class 125 Php431.00 

7 27 pieces 1” Check valve, class 125 Php735.00 

8 11 pieces 1
1

2
” Check valve, class 125 Php1,591.00 

9 6 pieces 2” Check valve, class 125 Php2,570.00 

10 415 pieces 1” Ø Gate valve, threaded type class 125 Php931.00 

11 12 pieces 1
1

2
” Ø Gate valve, threaded type Php1,886.00 

12 10 pieces 2” Ø Gate valve, threaded type  Php2,906.00 

13 8 pieces 2” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with companion 

steel flanges and BNG 
Php12,508.00 

14 4 pieces 3” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with companion 

steel flanges and BNG 
Php18,795.00 

15 7 pieces 4” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with companion 

steel flanges and BNG 
Php27,479.00 

16 3 pieces 6” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with companion 

steel flanges and BNG 
Php42,600.00 

17 1 piece 12” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with companion 

steel flanges and BNG 
Php108,370.00 

18 6 pieces 2” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with combination 

flanges and sealing ring and bolts & nuts 
Php11,845.00 

19 3 pieces 3” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with combination 

flanges and sealing ring and bolts & nuts 
Php19,464.00 

20 6 pieces 4” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with combination 

flanges and sealing ring and bolts & nuts 
Php23,001.00 

21 2 pieces 6” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with combination 

flanges and sealing ring and bolts & nuts 
Php39,310.00 

22 1 piece 10” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with combination 

flanges and sealing ring and bolts & nuts 
Php85,307.00 

23 1 piece 12” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with combination 

flanges and sealing ring and bolts & nuts 
Php106,302.00 

24 390 pieces 
1

2
” Ø HDPE coupling Php278.00 

25 50 pieces 
3

4
” Ø HDPE coupling Php196.00 

26 350 pieces 1” Ø HDPE coupling Php420.00 

27 40 pieces 2” Ø HDPE coupling Php1,046.00 

28 40 pieces 2” Ø HDPE female coupling adapter Php1,347.00 

29 1,930 pieces 
1

2
” Ø HDPE male coupling adapter Php210.00 

30 53 pieces 
3

4
” Ø HDPE male coupling adapter Php122.00 

31 530 pieces 1” Ø HDPE male coupling adapter Php167.00 

32 16 pieces 1
1

2
” Ø HDPE male coupling adapter Php636.00 

33 86 pieces 2” Ø HDPE male coupling adapter Php1,089.00 

34 520 pieces 1” Ø HDPE poly BST elbow Php381.00 

35 180 pieces 2” x 1” Tapping saddle Php4,196.00 

36 55 pieces 3” x 1” Tapping saddle Php5,883.00 

37 20 pieces 4” x 1” Tapping saddle Php4,668.00 

38 6 pieces Universal tapper 8” x 1” (for PVC) Php14,762.00 

39 3 pieces Universal tapper 8” x 2”  Php5,909.90 

40 3 pieces Universal tapper 10” x 2” Php6,144.97 

41 3 pieces Universal tapper 12” x 2” Php6,378.65 
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WHEREAS, AVK PHILIPPINES, INC. and FANM ENTERPRISES, INC. submitted their bids and 

during the opening of the technical bids on 08 April 2024, it was determined that both bidders 

submitted complete documentary requirements; thus, their bids were rated “passed”; 

 

WHEREAS, the technical proposals of the bidders were endorsed to the Technical Working Group 

(TWG) for evaluation, and on 16 April 2024 their offers were rated by the TWG as “complying”; 

 

WHEREAS, AVK PHILIPPINES, INC. did not submit any offer for items 1-12 and 24-41, while 

FANM ENTERPRISES, INC did not submit any offer for items 38-41; 

 

WHEREAS, on 29 April 2024, the financial bids of AVK PHILIPPINES, INC. and FANM 

ENTERPRISES, INC. were opened and the bids as read and calculated are as follows:  

 

 

DESCRIPTION 
BID PRICE  

(per piece) 

% 

VARIANCE 

FROM 

ABC 

ABC 

(per piece) 

 AVK PHILIPPINES, INC. 

1 1” Air release valve  No bid - Php15,400.00 

2 2” Air release valve No bid - Php27,527.00 

3 

1

2
” Ball valve/ stop cock ball type-lock 

wing (Threaded) 

No bid - Php638.00 

4 

3

4
” Ball valve/ stop cock ball type-lock 

wing (Threaded) 

No bid - Php915.00 

5 
1” Ball valve/ stop cock ball type-lock 

wing (Threaded) 
No bid - Php1,252.00 

6 
1

2
” Check valve, class 125 No bid - Php431.00 

7 1” Check valve, class 125 No bid - Php735.00 

8 1
1

2
” Check valve, class 125 No bid - Php1,591.00 

9 2” Check valve, class 125 No bid - Php2,570.00 

10 1” Ø Gate valve, threaded type class 125 No bid - Php931.00 

11 1
1

2
” Ø Gate valve, threaded type No bid - Php1,886.00 

12 2” Ø Gate valve, threaded type  No bid - Php2,906.00 

13 
2” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

companion steel flanges and BNG 
Php10,747.88 14.07% Php12,508.00 

14 
3” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

companion steel flanges and BNG 
Php15,342.88 18.36% Php18,795.00 

15 
4” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

companion steel flanges and BNG 
Php18,046.79 34.32% Php27,479.00 

16 
6” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

companion steel flanges and BNG 
Php32,666.51 23.31% Php42,600.00 

17 
12” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

companion steel flanges and BNG 
Php97,825.39 9.73% Php108,370.00 

18 

2” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

combination flanges and sealing ring and 

bolts & nuts 

Php10,543.20 10.99% Php11,845.00 

19 

3” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

combination flanges and sealing ring and 

bolts & nuts 

Php17,627.08 9.43% Php19,464.00 

20 

4” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

combination flanges and sealing ring and 

bolts & nuts 

Php20,234.87 12.02% Php23,001.00 

21 

6” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

combination flanges and sealing ring and 

bolts & nuts 

Php34,087.47 13.28% Php39,310.00 

22 

10” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

combination flanges and sealing ring and 

bolts & nuts 

Php81,146.24 4.87% Php85,307.00 

23 

12” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

combination flanges and sealing ring and 

bolts & nuts 

Php102,466.47 
3.60% 

Php106,302.00 

24 
1

2
” Ø HDPE coupling No bid - Php278.00 

25 
3

4
” Ø HDPE coupling No bid - Php196.00 

26 1” Ø HDPE coupling No bid - Php420.00 

27 2” Ø HDPE coupling No bid - Php1,046.00 

28 2” Ø HDPE female coupling adapter No bid - Php1,347.00 

29 
1

2
” Ø HDPE male coupling adapter No bid - Php210.00 
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DESCRIPTION 
BID PRICE  

(per piece) 

% 

VARIANCE 

FROM 

ABC 

ABC 

(per piece) 

30 
3

4
” Ø HDPE male coupling adapter No bid - Php122.00 

31 1” Ø HDPE male coupling adapter No bid - Php167.00 

32 1
1

2
” Ø HDPE male coupling adapter No bid - Php636.00 

33 2” Ø HDPE male coupling adapter No bid - Php1,089.00 

34 1” Ø HDPE poly BST elbow No bid - Php381.00 

35 2” x 1” Tapping saddle No bid - Php4,196.00 

36 3” x 1” Tapping saddle No bid - Php5,883.00 

37 4” x 1” Tapping saddle No bid - Php4,668.00 

38 Universal tapper 8” x 1” (for PVC) No bid - Php14,762.00 

39 Universal tapper 8” x 2”  No bid - Php5,909.90 

40 Universal tapper 10” x 2” No bid - Php6,144.97 

41 Universal tapper 12” x 2” No bid - Php6,378.65 

 FANM ENTERPRISES, INC. 

1 1” Air release valve  Php15,400.00 -0- Php15,400.00 

2 2” Air release valve Php27,527.00 -0- Php27,527.00 

3 

1

2
” Ball valve/ stop cock ball type-lock 

wing (Threaded) 

Php638.00 

-0- 

Php638.00 

4 

3

4
” Ball valve/ stop cock ball type-lock 

wing (Threaded) 

Php915.00 

-0- 

Php915.00 

5 
1” Ball valve/ stop cock ball type-lock 

wing (Threaded) 
Php1,252.00 

-0- 
Php1,252.00 

6 
1

2
” Check valve, class 125 Php431.00 -0- Php431.00 

7 1” Check valve, class 125 Php735.00 -0- Php735.00 

8 1
1

2
” Check valve, class 125 Php1,591.00 -0- Php1,591.00 

9 2” Check valve, class 125 Php2,570.00 -0- Php2,570.00 

10 1” Ø Gate valve, threaded type class 125 Php931.00 -0- Php931.00 

11 1
1

2
” Ø Gate valve, threaded type Php1,886.00 -0- Php1,886.00 

12 2” Ø Gate valve, threaded type  Php2,906.00 -0- Php2,906.00 

13 
2” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

companion steel flanges and BNG 
Php12,508.00 

-0- 
Php12,508.00 

14 
3” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

companion steel flanges and BNG 
Php18,795.00 

-0- 
Php18,795.00 

15 
4” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

companion steel flanges and BNG 
Php27,479.00 

-0- 
Php27,479.00 

16 
6” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

companion steel flanges and BNG 
Php42,600.00 

-0- 
Php42,600.00 

17 
12” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

companion steel flanges and BNG 
Php108,370.00 

-0- 
Php108,370.00 

18 

2” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

combination flanges and sealing ring and 

bolts & nuts 

Php11,845.00 

-0- 

Php11,845.00 

19 

3” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

combination flanges and sealing ring and 

bolts & nuts 

Php19,464.00 

-0- 

Php19,464.00 

20 

4” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

combination flanges and sealing ring and 

bolts & nuts 

Php23,001.00 

-0- 

Php23,001.00 

21 

6” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

combination flanges and sealing ring and 

bolts & nuts 

Php39,310.00 

-0- 

Php39,310.00 

22 

10” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

combination flanges and sealing ring and 

bolts & nuts 

Php85,307.00 

-0- 

Php85,307.00 

23 

12” Ø Gate valve, flanged type with 

combination flanges and sealing ring and 

bolts & nuts 

Php106,302.00 

-0- 

Php106,302.00 

24 
1

2
” Ø HDPE coupling Php278.00 -0- Php278.00 

25 
3

4
” Ø HDPE coupling Php196.00 -0- Php196.00 

26 1” Ø HDPE coupling Php420.00 -0- Php420.00 
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DESCRIPTION 
BID PRICE  

(per piece) 

% 

VARIANCE 

FROM 

ABC 

ABC 

(per piece) 

27 2” Ø HDPE coupling Php1,046.00 -0- Php1,046.00 

28 2” Ø HDPE female coupling adapter Php1,347.00 -0- Php1,347.00 

29 
1

2
” Ø HDPE male coupling adapter Php210.00 -0- Php210.00 

30 
3

4
” Ø HDPE male coupling adapter Php122.00 -0- Php122.00 

31 1” Ø HDPE male coupling adapter Php167.00 -0- Php167.00 

32 1
1

2
” Ø HDPE male coupling adapter Php636.00 -0- Php636.00 

33 2” Ø HDPE male coupling adapter Php1,089.00 -0- Php1,089.00 

34 1” Ø HDPE poly BST elbow Php381.00 -0- Php381.00 

35 2” x 1” Tapping saddle Php4,196.00 -0- Php4,196.00 

36 3” x 1” Tapping saddle Php5,883.00 -0- Php5,883.00 

37 4” x 1” Tapping saddle Php4,668.00 -0- Php4,668.00 

38 Universal tapper 8” x 1” (for PVC) No bid - Php14,762.00 

39 Universal tapper 8” x 2”  No bid - Php5,909.90 

40 Universal tapper 10” x 2” No bid - Php6,144.97 

41 Universal tapper 12” x 2” No bid - Php6,378.65 

 

WHEREAS, upon post-qualification, careful examination, validation, and verification of all the 

documents submitted by and of the financial bids of the bidders, it has been determined that 

the financial bids of AVK PHILIPPINES, INC. for items 13-23 are the lowest calculated responsive 

bids; while the financial bids of FANM ENTERPRISES, INC. for items 1-12 and 24-37 are 

determined to be the lone calculated responsive bids;  

 

NOW THEREFORE, on motion duly seconded, be it 

 

RESOLVED, as it is hereby resolved, to recommend to the Head of the Procuring Entity awarding 

the procurement of items 1-12 and 24-37 to FANM ENTERPRISES, INC. for being the lone 

calculated responsive bidder and items 13-23 to AVK PHILIPPINES, INC. for being the lowest 

calculated bidder with their offered brands, specifications, and bid prices; 

 

RESOLVED further, to declare a failure of bidding for the procurement of items 38-41 for having 

received no bids.   

 

UNANIMOUSLY APPROVED (30 April 2024) 

 

 

Engr. Noriel C. Calpito 

Vice-Chairperson 

 

Rodrigo O. De Venecia, Jr 

                  Member 

 

Engr. Shayne Margie S. Abellera                   

                      Member 

 

 

Romeo S. Adriano 

Member 

   

 

 Engr. Dominic T. Agusdan 

                    Member 

 

 

Atty. Francess Louise E. Gener 

Member 

  

 

 

Atty. Ma. Luisa C. Tenedero 

Chairperson 

 

     

    Attested by: 

 

    Apple Jane P. Aviles                                                                 Sharlene M. Durante 

         Secretariat                                                                                    Secretariat 

                                   

 

  Approved by:  

 

 

                                           Engr. Salvador M. Royeca 

                   General Manager 
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